

BID TALLY AND ATTENDANCE SHEET

BID #: B16-06

BID TITLE: Road Shouldering Materials - Aggregates for Bases

DATE: May 17, 2016 TIME: 2:00 p.m.

DEPARTMENT: Road and Bridge

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE: Recycled Asphalt (Price per Ton)</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE: Recycled Concrete (Price per Ton)</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE: Class 5 Road Base (Price per Ton)</u>
Pete Lien and Sons, Inc.	no bid	no bid	\$10.25
Barker Construction Co., Inc.	\$10.00	\$10.00	no bid
Connell Resources, Inc.	no bid	no bid	\$10.00
Don Kehn Construction	\$11.50 (Class 5 and/or 6)	\$11.50	\$9.50
Bestway Concrete and Aggregate	no bid	\$9.50 (Class 6)	no bid
Recycled Materials of Colorado, LLC (RMC)	\$5.95	\$4.75	no bid

<u>ATTENDEES AT BID OPENING</u>	<u>BUSINESS NAME</u>
Sarah Brightman, Purchasing Agent	Larimer County Purchasing
Deb Trujillo, Department Specialist	Larimer County Purchasing
Jennifer Lindblad	Connell Resources, Inc.
Jim Frick	Larimer County Road & Bridge

LARIMER COUNTY BID #B16-06
ROAD SHOULDERING MATERIALS - AGGREGATES FOR BASES
ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT
May 17, 2016, 2:00 P.M.

Bids to consider the purchase of road shouldering materials for the Larimer County Road and Bridge Department were received and opened on Tuesday, May 17, 2016 at 2:00 p.m. in the Purchasing Department. Bids were opened by Sarah Brightman, Purchasing Agent, and recorded by Deb Trujillo, Department Specialist.

The following bids were received:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE:</u> <u>Recycled Asphalt</u> <u>(Price per Ton)</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE:</u> <u>Recycled</u> <u>Concrete</u> <u>(Price per Ton)</u>	<u>MATERIAL TYPE:</u> <u>Class 5 Road</u> <u>Base</u> <u>(Price per Ton)</u>
Pete Lien and Sons, Inc.	no bid	no bid	\$10.25
Barker Construction Co., Inc.	\$10.00	\$10.00	no bid
Connell Resources, Inc.	no bid	no bid	\$10.00
Don Kehn Construction	\$11.50 (Class 5 and/or 6)	\$11.50	\$9.50
Bestway Concrete and Aggregate	no bid	\$9.50 (Class 6)	no bid
Recycled Materials of Colorado, LLC (RMC)	\$5.95	\$4.75	no bid

No decision of award was made pending review and recommendation by the Larimer County Road and Bridge Department.

The Larimer County Road and Bridge Department reviewed the bids and recommends accepting the bids from each of the six bidders per the attached departmental recommendation.

The Larimer County Purchasing Department concurs with the above recommendations.



Heather MacMillan
Purchasing Director



Carol L. Block, Financial Services Director
For the Board of Larimer County Commissioners



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 W. Oak Street, Suite 4000

Fort Collins, Colorado 80521

TO: Todd Juergens, Road and Bridge Director
Jim Frick, R&B Functional Group Manager
FROM: Sarah Brightman, Purchasing Agent
DATE: 5/17/2016
SUBJECT: B16-06, Road Shouldering Materials - Aggregates for Bases

Transmitted for your review and recommendation, are the six (6) vendor bids received to consider the retention of one or more vendors for as-needed road shouldering materials. Bidders offered from one material to all three (3) requested, and alternates in the same class specification, for a total of 12 individual bids of materials.

When you have completed your review of the bids, please prepare your recommendation on this form and return the form to me. If you do not recommend awarding the bid to the lowest bidder, please explain why. This document will be considered a public record and open to inspection.

I recommend Pete Lien & Sons for Class 5 Road Base at the amount of \$ 10.25 /ton

I recommend Barker Construction for Recycled Asphalt at the amount of \$ 10.00 /ton

I recommend Barker Construction for Recycled Concrete at the amount of \$ 10.00 /ton

I recommend Connell for Class 5 Road Base at the amount of \$ 10.00 /ton

I recommend Don Kehn for Recycled Asphalt Class 5 at the amount of \$ 11.50 /ton

I recommend Don Kehn for Recycled Asphalt Class 6 at the amount of \$ 11.50/ton

I recommend Don Kehn for Recycled Concrete at the amount of \$ 11.50/ton

I recommend Don Kehn for Class 5 Road Base at the amount of \$ 9.50/ton

I recommend Bestway for Recycled Concrete Class 6 at the amount of \$ 9.50/ton

I recommend Bestway for 4" Minus Recycled Concrete at the amount of \$ 10.50 /ton

I recommend RMC for Recycled Asphalt at the amount of \$ 5.95/ton

I recommend RMC for Recycled Concrete at the amount of \$ 4.75/ton

for the following reasons: Suitable materials offered at reasonable prices per ton.

THIS RECOMMENDATION MUST BE SIGNED BY THE DEPARTMENT HEAD


DEPARTMENT HEAD SIGNATURE

Road & Bridge
DEPARTMENT

5/24/16
DATE

Thank you.